
1Finance

FINANCE BILL 2024

ARRANGEMENT OF CLAUSES

Chapter I

PRELIMINARY

	 Clause

	 1.	 Short title

	 2.	 Amendment of Acts

Chapter II

AMENDMENTS TO THE INCOME TAX ACT 1967

	 3.	 Commencement of amendments to the Income Tax Act 1967

	 4.	 Amendment of section 6

	 5.	 Amendment of section 15c

	 6.	 Amendment of section 34

	 7.	 Amendment of section 44

	 8.	 Amendment of section 45a

	 9.	 Amendment of section 46

	 10.	 Substitution of section 46b

	 11.	 Amendment of section 47

	 12.	 Amendment of section 48

	 13.	 Amendment of section 49

	 14.	 Amendment of section 107c

	 15.	 Amendment of section 108

	 16.	 Amendment of Schedule 1

	 17.	 Amendment of Schedule 6



2 Bill

Chapter III

AMENDMENTS TO THE REAL PROPERTY GAINS TAX ACT 1976

	 Clause

	 18.	 Commencement of amendments to the Real Property Gains Tax Act 1976

	 19.	 Amendment of section 3

	 20.	 Amendment of section 7

	 21.	 Amendment of section 11

	 22.	 Amendment of section 21

Chapter IV

AMENDMENTS TO THE STAMP ACT 1949

	 23.	 Commencement of amendments to the Stamp Act 1949

	 24.	 Amendment of section 20a

	 25.	 New sections 36ca and 36cb

	 26.	 Amendment of section 47a

	 27.	 Amendment of First Schedule

Chapter V

AMENDMENT TO THE PETROLEUM (INCOME TAX) ACT 1967

	 28.	 Commencement of amendment to the Petroleum (Income Tax) Act 1967

	 29.	 Amendment of First Schedule

Chapter VI

AMENDMENT TO THE FINANCE ACT 2012

	 30.	 Commencement of amendment to the Finance Act 2012

	 31.	 Amendment of section 3

Chapter VII

AMENDMENT TO THE FINANCE (NO. 2) ACT 2023

	 32.	 Commencement of amendment to the Finance (No. 2) Act 2023

	 33.	 Amendment of section 30



3Finance

A BILL

i n t i t u l e d

An Act to amend the Income Tax Act 1967, the Real Property 
Gains Tax Act 1976, the Stamp Act 1949, the Petroleum  
(Income Tax) Act 1967, the Finance Act 2012 and the Finance 
(No. 2) Act 2023.

	 [	 ]

ENACTED by the Parliament of Malaysia pursuant to Article 68  
of the Federal Constitution as follows:

Chapter I

PRELIMINARY

Short title

1.	 This Act may be cited as the Finance Act 2024.

Amendment of Acts

2.	 The Income Tax Act 1967 [Act 53], the Real Property 
Gains Tax Act 1976 [Act 169], the Stamp Act 1949 [Act 378],  
the Petroleum (Income Tax) Act 1967 [Act 543], the Finance 
Act 2012 [Act 742] and the Finance (No. 2) Act 2023 [Act 851]  
are amended in the manner specified in Chapters II, III, IV, V, 
VI and VII respectively.



4 Bill

Chapter II

AMENDMENTS TO THE INCOME TAX ACT 1967

Commencement of amendments to the Income Tax Act 1967

3.	 (1)	 Sections 4, 8, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16 and 17, and paragraphs 
9(a), (b), (c), (d) and (g) have effect for the year of assessment 
2025 and subsequent years of assessment.

	 (2)	 Sections 5 and 10 come into operation on 1 January 2025. 

	 (3)	 Section 6 comes into operation on 1 April 2025.

	 (4)	 Section 7 comes into operation on the coming into operation 
of this Act.

	 (5)	 Paragraphs 9(e), (f) and (h) have effect from the year  
of assessment 2025 until the year of assessment 2027.

Amendment of section 6

4.	 The Income Tax Act 1967, which is referred to as the  
“principal Act” in this Chapter, is amended in subsection 6(1)—

	 (a)	 in paragraph (q), by substituting for the full stop at the 
end of the paragraph a semicolon; and

	 (b)	 by inserting after paragraph (q) the following paragraph:

	 “(r)	 notwithstanding anything contrary to this Act 
or any other written law, income tax shall be 
charged for each year of assessment upon the 
income of an individual, who is a shareholder 
of a company, either through direct shareholding 
or a nominee, which consists of dividend paid, 
credited or distributed, whether in monetary form 
or otherwise, by the company, and the dividend 
is deemed by virtue of section 14 to be derived 
from Malaysia, at the appropriate rate as specified 
under Part XXII of Schedule 1.”.



5Finance

Amendment of section 15c

5.	 Section 15c of the principal Act is amended—

	 (a)	 in subsection (1), by substituting for the words  
“subsection (2)” the words “subsections (2) and (2a)”;

	 (b)	 in subsection (2)—

	 (i)	 by inserting after the words “the date of acquisition 
of the shares of the relevant company” the words 
“by the company, limited liability partnership, 
trust body or co-operative society”;

	 (ii)	 in paragraph (b)—

	 (A)	 by substituting for the words “asset:”  
the words “asset; or”; and

	 (B)	 by deleting the words “Provided that 
the defined value of the real property 
situated in Malaysia (including any right 
or interest thereof) owned by another 
controlled company, is not less than 
seventy-five per cent of the value of its 
total tangible asset; or”;

	 (iii)	 in the proviso, by substituting for the full stop 
at the end of the proviso a colon; and

	 (iv)	 by inserting after the proviso the following second 
proviso:

	 “Provided further that where at any date  
the relevant company disposes of the real property  
or the shares of another controlled company, 
or both, whereby the defined value of the real 
property or the shares of another controlled 
company, or both, owned at the date of disposal 
and thereafter is less than seventy-five per cent  
of the value of its total tangible assets,  
that relevant company shall not be regarded 
as a relevant company under subsection (1) 
as from that date of disposal.”;



6 Bill

	 (c)	 by inserting after subsection (2) the following subsection:

	 “(2a)  Where the relevant company is a real property 
company as defined under subparagraph 34a(6) of 
Schedule 2 to the Real Property Gains Tax Act 1976 
prior to 1 January 2024, the date of acquisition of 
shares of the relevant company shall be deemed to be 
the date of acquisition of those shares as determined 
in accordance with subparagraph 34a(2) of Schedule 2  
to that Act.”;

	 (d)	 by substituting for subsection (3) the following subsection:

	 “(3)  Where, on the date of acquisition of the shares 
of the relevant company, the defined value referred to  
in paragraphs (2)(a), (b) and (c) is less than seventy-five  
per cent of the value of its total tangible asset and  
the relevant company subsequently acquires real property  
or shares of another controlled company, or both, 
resulting in the defined value of the real property or 
shares, or both, owned on the date of acquisition by 
the relevant company being not less than seventy-five  
per cent of the value of its total tangible asset  
(hereinafter referred to as the “subsequent acquisition 
date”), the shares of the relevant company shall be 
deemed to be acquired on the subsequent acquisition 
date.”;

	 (e)	 in subsection (4)—

	 (i)	 in paragraph (a)—

	 (A)	 b y  s u b s t i t u t i n g  f o r  t h e  w o r d s  
“paragraph 3(a)” the words “subsection (3)”; 

	 (B)	 by inserting after the words “in accordance 
with the” the word “following”;

	 (C)	 in the formula, in explanation A,  
by substituting for the words “referred to in  
subsection (1)” the words “disposed by 
a company, limited liability partnership, 
trust body or co-operative society”; and



7Finance

	 (D)	 in the formula, in explanations B and C,  
by substituting for the words “date of 
acquisition of the shares of the relevant 
company referred to in subsection (1)”  
the words “subsequent acquisition date”; 
and

	 (ii)	 in paragraph (b), by substituting for the words 
“paragraph (3)(b)” the words “subsection (2)”;

	 (f)	 by inserting after subsection (4) the following subsection:

	 “(4a)  Where subsection (2a) applies, the acquisition 
price of the real property company as determined 
under subparagraph 34a(3) of Schedule 2 to the  
Real Property Gains Tax Act 1976 prior to 1 January 2024  
shall be deemed to be the acquisition price of the 
shares of the relevant company.”; and

	 (g)	 in subsection (5)—

	 (i)	 by inserting before the definition of “defined value”  
the following definition:

	 ‘ “another controlled company” means  
a controlled company which owns real property 
situated in Malaysia (including any right 
or interest thereof) or shares in another 
controlled company, or owns both, where  
the defined value of the real property  
or shares, or both, is not less than seventy-five  
per cent of the value of its total tangible 
asset;’; and

	 (ii)	 in the definition of “value of its total tangible 
assets”, by inserting before the word “means” 
the words “in relation to the relevant company 
or another controlled company,”.



8 Bill

Amendment of section 34

6.	 Subsection 34(6) of the principal Act is amended—

	 (a)	 by substituting for paragraph (h) the following paragraph:

	 “(h)	 an amount equal to the expenditure incurred  
by the relevant person in the relevant period on the  
provision of services, public amenities and 
contributions to a charity or community project 
pertaining to education, health, housing, conservation 
or preservation of environment, enhancement  
of income of the poor, infrastructure, information 
and communication technology or maintenance 
of a building designated as a heritage site by  
the Commissioner of Heritage under the  
National Heritage Act 2005 [Act 645], and where 
the amount of expenditure is—

	 (i)	 not more than three hundred thousand 
ringgit, the amount of expenditure shall 
be verified and the charity or community 
project shall be approved, by the relevant 
government authority; or

	 (ii)	 more than three hundred thousand ringgit, 
the amount of expenditure shall be verified 
by the relevant government authority and 
the charity or community project shall be 
approved by the Minister:

	 Provided that where a deduction has been 
made under this paragraph, no further deduction 
of the same amount shall be allowed under  
subsection 44(6).”; and

	 (b)	 by substituting for paragraph (ha) the following paragraph:

	 “(ha)	 an amount equal to the expenditure incurred  
by a company on the provision of infrastructure  
in relation to its business which is available  
for public use, and where the amount of  
expenditure is—

	 (i)	 not more than three hundred thousand 
ringgit, the amount of expenditure and  
the provision of infrastructure shall be 
verified and approved by the relevant 
government authority; or



9Finance

	 (ii)	 more than three hundred thousand  
ringgit, the amount of expenditure 
shall  be verified by the relevant 
government authority and the provision 
of infrastructure shall be approved  
by the Minister:

	 Provided that where a deduction has been 
made under this paragraph, no further deduction 
of the same amount shall be allowed under  
subsection 44(6).”.

Amendment of section 44

7.	 Subsection 44(7)  of the principal Act is amended in  
the definition of “organization”, in paragraph (k), by deleting  
the words “as defined in subsection 46(2)”.

Amendment of section 45a

8.	 Subsection 45a(1) of the principal Act is  amended  
by substituting for the words “five thousand ringgit” the words  
“six thousand ringgit”.

Amendment of section 46

9.	 Subsection 46(1) of the principal Act is amended—

	 (a)	 in paragraph (c)—

	 (i)	 by substituting for the word “parents” wherever 
appearing the words “parents or grandparents”;

	 (ii)	 in the proviso—

	 (A)	 in subsubparagraph (b), by substituting 
for the words ‘ “parents” ’ the words  
‘ “parents or grandparents” ’; and



10 Bill

	 (B)	 by inserting after subsubparagraph (c)  
the following subsubparagraph:

	 “(ca)	 “complete medical examination” 
shall include any vaccination;”;

	 (b)	 in paragraph (e) ,  by substituting for the words  
“six thousand ringgit” the words “seven thousand ringgit”;

	 (c)	 in paragraph (h)—

	 (i)	 in subparagraph (i), by inserting after the word 
“expenses” the words “or payment of fees for 
disease detection test”; and

	 (ii)	 by substituting for subparagraph (ii) the following 
subparagraph:

	 “(ii)	 the purchase of self-testing medical  
device registered under the Medical 
Device Act 2012 [Act 737] (not being 
used for the purposes of his own 
business), as evidenced by receipts  
of the purchase; or”;

	 (d)	 in paragraph (ha), by substituting for the words  
“four thousand ringgit” the words “six thousand ringgit”;

	 (e)	 by substituting for paragraph (k) the following paragraph:

	 “(k)	 an amount limited to a maximum of eight thousand 
ringgit deposited for each basis year for the 
years of assessment 2025, 2026 and 2027 by that 
individual for his child into the Skim Simpanan 
Pendidikan Nasional account established under the 
Perbadanan Tabung Pendidikan Tinggi Nasional 
Act 1997 [Act 566]:

	 Provided that—

	 (i)	 if any withdrawal is made from the 
account by that individual in that basis 
year, the amount deposited during that 



11Finance

year shall be reduced by that withdrawal 
and regard shall be had only to the 
reduced amount subject to a maximum 
amount of eight thousand ringgit;

	 (ii)	 t h e  w i t h d r a w a l  r e f e r r e d  t o  i n  
subparagraph (i) shall not include  
the amount withdrawn for higher 
education which is received by the child;

	 (iii)	 where a wife living together with her 
husband is assessed separately for that 
year, the deduction under this paragraph 
shall only be allowed either to the 
husband or to the wife; and

	 (iv)	 the maximum amount of deduction 
under this paragraph shall apply, 
notwithstanding that, that individual 
may have more than one child;”;

	 (f)	 in the proviso to paragraph (r), in paragraph (c),  
by substituting for the words “until 2024” the words 
“until 2027”;

	 (g)	 in paragraph (u)—

	 (i)	 by substituting for the words “or child” wherever 
appearing the words “, child or parents”; and

	 (ii)	 by inserting the following proviso:

	 “Provided that for the purposes of this 
paragraph, “parents” shall be individuals 
resident in Malaysia; and”; and

	 (h)	 by substituting for paragraph (v) the following paragraph:
	
	 “(v)	 expenses expended in that basis year by that 

individual—

	 (i)	 for the payment of installation, rental,  
purchase including hire-purchase of equipment 
or subscription for use of electric vehicle 



12 Bill

charging facility for his own vehicle and 
not being used for the purposes of his own 
business for each basis year for the years 
of assessment 2023, 2024, 2025, 2026 and 
2027; or

	 (ii)	 for the purchase of food waste compost 
machine used for the household purpose of 
the individual for the years of assessment  
of 2025, 2026 and 2027:

	 Provided that—

	 (a)	 the claim is evidenced by 
receipts issued in respect of 
the payment or purchase, as the  
case may be;

	 (b)	 t h e  d e d u c t i o n  u n d e r  
subparagraph (ii) shall only be  
claimed once in the years 
of assessment as stated in 
subparagraph (ii); and

	 (c)	 the total amount of deduction 
under this paragraph is subject 
to a maximum amount of two  
thousand and five hundred ringgit;”.

Substitution of section 46b

10.	 The principal Act is amended by substituting for section 46b 
the following section:

“Deduction for individual on interest expended

46b.  (1)  Subject to this section, in the case of an individual 
who is a citizen and resident for the basis year for the 
relevant year, there shall be allowed for that relevant 



13Finance

year personal deduction in respect of interest expended  
in that basis year by the individual to finance the purchase 
of a residential property:

  Provided that—

	 (a)	 the residential property is the first residential property 
purchased by the individual to be occupied as his 
place of residence and limited to only one unit;

	 (b)	 the Sale and Purchase Agreement for the purchase  
is executed on or after 1 January 2025 but  
not later than 31 December 2027; and

	 (c)	 the individual shall not derive any income in respect 
of that residential property.

	 (2)  Subject to subsection (3)—

	 (a)	 there shall be allowed to that individual a deduction 
of a maximum amount of—

	 (i)	 seven thousand ringgit, in relation to  
a residential property where the purchase 
price is not more than five hundred thousand 
ringgit; or

	 (ii)	 five thousand ringgit, in relation to a residential 
property where the purchase price is more 
than five hundred thousand ringgit but not 
more than seven hundred and fifty thousand 
ringgit; and

	 (b)	 the deduction under paragraph (2)(a) shall be for each  
basis year for a year of assessment for a period 
of three consecutive basis years beginning from 
the basis year in which the interest referred to in 
subsection (1) is first expended by that individual.

	 (3)  Where—

	 (a)	 two or more individuals are each entitled to claim 
deduction for the relevant year under this section  
for interest expended in respect of the same residential 
property; and



14 Bill

	 (b)	 the total amount of interest expended by those 
individuals in the basis year for that relevant year 
exceed the amount of deduction allowable for that 
relevant year under subsection (2),

there shall be allowed to each of those individuals for that 
relevant year an amount to be determined in accordance with 
the following formula:

A X
B
C

where A is the total amount of deduction allowed 
under subsection (2) for that relevant year;

B is the total interest expended in the 
basis year for that relevant year by that 
individual; and

C is the total interest expended in the basis 
year for that relevant year by all such 
individuals.

	 (4)  For the purposes of subsection (1), any amount  
expended by the wife or the husband in the relevant year—

	 (a)	 where subsection 45(2) applies, shall be deemed  
to have been expended by the husband of the wife 
who elects or by the wife of the husband who elects, 
as the case may be; or

	 (b)	 where the wife or the husband has no total income, 
shall be deemed to have been expended by the 
husband of that wife or the wife of that husband, 
as the case may be:

	 Provided that where paragraph 45(2)(b) applies or where 
the husband has no total income, any amount expended  
by the husband shall be deemed to have been expended by 
the wife who has been allowed a deduction under section 45a.

	 (5)  For the purposes of this section, “residential property” 
means a house, condominium unit, apartment or flat which 
is built as a dwelling house.”.



15Finance

Amendment of section 47

11.	 Paragraph 47(1)(b)  of the principal Act is amended  
by substituting for the words “five thousand ringgit” the words 
“six thousand ringgit”.

Amendment of section 48

12.	 Paragraph 48(2)(b) of the principal Act  is amended  
by substituting for the words “six thousand ringgit” the words 
“eight thousand ringgit”.

Amendment of section 49

13.	 Subsection 49(1b) of the principal Act is amended  
by substituting for the words “three thousand ringgit” wherever 
appearing the words “four thousand ringgit”.

Amendment of section 107c

14.	 Subsection 107c(8) of the principal Act is amended in the 
proviso by substituting for the words “ninth month” the words 
“eleventh month”.

Amendment of section 108

15.	 Section 108 of the principal Act is amended—

	 (a)	 by renumbering the existing section as subsection (1); 
and

	 (b)	 by inserting after the renumbered subsection (1)  
the following subsection:

	 “(2)  Where a dividend is paid, credited or distributed, 
whether in monetary form or otherwise, by a company 
to any of its shareholders which is an individual, 
either through direct shareholding or a nominee,  
and the dividend is deemed by virtue of section 14  
to be derived from Malaysia, the company shall,  



16 Bill

upon paying, crediting or distributing the dividend, 
furnish the shareholders with a certificate setting forth 
in respect of the dividend—

	 (a)	 the gross amount; and

	 (b)	 the amount paid or credited or where the 
dividend consists of property other than  
money, the amount of the market value of that 
property at the time of the distribution of the 
dividend.”.

Amendment of Schedule 1

16.	 Schedule 1 to the principal Act is amended by inserting after 
Part XXI the following part:

“Part XXII

	 1.	 Notwithstanding Part I, income tax shall be charged upon the income 
of an individual which consists of dividend paid, credited or 
distributed, whether in monetary form or otherwise, by a company, 
and the dividend is deemed by virtue of section 14 to be derived 
from Malaysia, in excess of one hundred thousand ringgit at 
the rate of 2 per cent on every ringgit of the chargeable income  
in respect of such dividend.

	 2.	 In this Part, where the individual has income from a source other  
than dividend referred to in paragraph 1, the chargeable income  
of the individual referred to in that paragraph, shall be as prescribed 
by the Minister.”.

Amendment of Schedule 6

17.	 Paragraph 12b of Schedule 6 to the principal Act is amended—

	 (a)	 by renumbering the existing paragraph as subparagraph (1); 

	 (b)	 in the renumbered subparagraph (1), by inserting  
after the words “to any person” the words “other than 
an individual”; and



17Finance

	 (c)	 by inserting after the renumbered subparagraph (1)  
the following subparagraph:

	 “(2)  Any dividend paid, credited or distributed to  
an individual, whether in monetary form or otherwise, amounting 
to one hundred thousand ringgit or less where the company 
paying such dividend is not entitled to deduct tax under this 
Act and any deduction in relation to such dividend shall be 
disregarded for the purpose of ascertaining the chargeable 
income of the individual.”.

Chapter III

AMENDMENTS TO THE REAL PROPERTY GAINS
TAX ACT 1976

Commencement of amendments to the Real Property Gains 
Tax Act 1976

18.	 This Chapter comes into operation on 1 January 2025.

Amendment of section 3

19.	 The Real Property Gains Tax Act 1976, which is referred  
to as the “principal Act” in this Chapter, is amended in section 3—

	 (a)	 in subsection (2)—

	 (i)	 by deleting the word “total”;

	 (ii)	 in the English language text, by substituting  
for the word “gains” the word “gain”; and

	 (iii)	 in the English language text, by substituting  
for the word “assets” the word “asset”; and

	 (b)	 by inserting after subsection (2) the following subsection:

	 “(2a)  For the purposes of this Act, the chargeable 
gain accruing on the disposal of chargeable asset  
for a year of assessment shall be—

	 (a)	 ascertained by reference to each disposal  
separately; and



18 Bill

	 (b)	 treated as a separate chargeable gain from each 
disposal of chargeable asset for the year of 
assessment.”.

Amendment of section 7

20.	 Subsection 7(4) of the principal Act is amended—

	 (a)	 by substituting for paragraph (a) the following paragraph:

	 “(a)	 there is an allowable loss in respect of a disposal, 
such allowable loss shall only be allowed as  
a deduction to reduce the chargeable gain of  
a person in the subsequent disposal of chargeable 
asset in the same year of assessment in which 
the disposal was made; and”; and

	 (b)	 in paragraph (b)—

	 (i)	 by deleting the word “total” wherever appearing; 
and

	 (ii)	 by inserting after the words “which there is total 
chargeable gain” the words “from the disposal 
of chargeable asset at an earlier point in time”.

Amendment of section 11

21.	 Section 11 of the principal Act is amended by substituting 
for the words “total amount of his chargeable gains” the words 
“amount of his chargeable gain accruing on each disposal of 
chargeable asset”.

Amendment of section 21

22.	 Section 21 of the principal Act is amended—

	 (a)	 in subsection (1a)—

	 (i)	 by deleting the words “or additional tax”;



19Finance

	 (ii)	 by substituting for the words “sixty days”  
the words “ninety days”; and

	 (iii)	 by deleting the words “or additional assessment”; 
and

	 (b)	 by substituting for subsection (4) the following subsection:

	 “(4)  Subject to subsection (3), where any tax due 
and payable on the service of a notice in accordance 
with subsection (1) or (2) has not been paid within 
thirty days after the service of that notice (or within  
such longer period as may be allowed by the  
Director General) or where any tax due and payable 
under subsection (1a) has not been paid within the period  
of ninety days from the date of disposal, so much of 
the tax as is unpaid upon the expiration of the thirty 
days or that longer period, or upon the expiration of 
the ninety days, as the case may be, shall, without 
any further notice being served on him, be increased 
by a sum equal to ten per cent of the tax so unpaid, 
and that sum shall be recoverable as if it were tax 
due and payable under this Act:

	 Provided that—

	 (a)	 if the tax payable is reduced on appeal  
or otherwise, the sum paid or payable by way 
of increase shall be reduced proportionately; and

	 (b)	 the Director General may, in his discretion, 
for any good cause shown, remit the whole 
or any part of any increase in the tax payable 
under this subsection.”.

Chapter IV

AMENDMENTS TO THE STAMP ACT 1949

Commencement of amendments to the Stamp Act 1949

23.	 (1)	 Sections 24, 26 and 27, and section 25 in relation  
to section 36cb of the Stamp Act 1949 come into operation  
on 1 January 2025.



20 Bill

	 (2)	 Section 25 in relation to section 36ca of the Stamp  
Act 1949 comes into operation on 1 January 2026.

Amendment of section 20a

24.	 The Stamp Act 1949, which is  referred to as the  
“principal Act” in this Chapter, is amended in section 20a—

	 (a)	 by renumbering the existing section as subsection (1);

	 (b)	 in the renumbered subsection (1)—

	 (i)	 by substituting for the words “, any consideration 
is paid or given, or agreed to be paid or given, 
for equality” the words “with or without 
consideration”; and

	 (ii)	 in paragraph (a), by substituting for the words 
“the same ad valorem duty as a conveyance  
on sale for the consideration, and with that duty 
only” the words “ad valorem duty as if it were 
a conveyance on sale”; and

	 (c)	 by inserting after the renumbered subsection (1)  
the following subsection:

	 “(2)  Notwithstanding subsection (1),  where  
an instrument is chargeable with a duty in respect of 
an exchange of any real property for any real 
property or upon the partition or division of any  
real property, and no consideration is paid or given,  
or agreed to be paid or given, the instrument shall be  
chargeable with the duty of ten ringgit only if—

	 (a)	 in such partition or division both transferor and 
transferee are the original owners of the real 
property;



21Finance

	 (b)	 such exchange of real property is between any 
person and a Ruler of a State or the Government 
of Malaysia or of any State; or

	 (c)	 such exchange of real property is between  
husband and wife, parent and child, grandparent 
and grandchild or among siblings.”.

New sections 36ca and 36cb

25.	 The principal Act is amended by inserting after section 36c 
the following sections:

“Assessment and additional assessment in certain cases

36ca.  (1)  The Collector, where it appears to him that no  
or no sufficient assessment has been made on an instrument 
chargeable to duty, may in that year or within five years after 
the date the duty is paid or would have been paid make an 
assessment or additional assessment, as the case may be, 
in respect of that instrument in the amount or additional 
amount of duty payable or in the additional amount of duty 
in which, according to the best of the Collector’s judgment, 
the assessment with respect to that instrument ought to have 
been made.

	 (2)  The Collector, where it appears to him that—

	 (a)	 any form of fraud or wilful default has been committed 
by or on behalf of any person; or

	 (b)	 any person has been negligent,

in connection with or in relation to duty, may at any time 
make an assessment in respect of that instrument for the 
purpose of making good any loss of duty attributable to the 
fraud, wilful default or negligence in question.

Minimum amount of duty

36cb.  Notwithstanding any other provision of this Act, 
an amount of ten ringgit shall be imposed as duty for each 
instrument where the duty is less than ten ringgit except  
for cheque and contract note.”.



22 Bill

Amendment of section 47a

26.	 Section 47a of the principal Act is amended by substituting 
for subsection (1) the following subsection:

	 “(1)  An instrument which is not stamped within the period 
specified in or under section 40, 43 or 47 may be stamped on 
payment of the unpaid duty and a penalty of—

	 (a)	 fifty ringgit or ten per centum of the amount of the 
deficient duty, whichever sum be the greater, if the 
instrument is stamped within three months after the 
time for stamping; or

	 (b)	 one hundred ringgit or twenty per centum of the amount 
of the deficient duty, whichever sum be the greater, 
in any other case.”.

Amendment of First Schedule

27.	 The First Schedule to the principal Act is amended—

	 (a)	 by substituting for item 12 the following item:

Item Description of Instrument Proper Stamp Duty

“12 ASSIGNMENT:

(a)	 By way of security or of any 
security

See Charge

(b)	 Upon a sale or otherwise See Conveyance

(c)	 Of policy of life insurance—

	 (i)	 by way of gift or trust, 
where the sum insured—

	 (A)	 does not exceed 
RM100,000.00

	 (B)	 exceeds 
RM100,000.00 but 
does not exceed 
RM500,000.00

RM10.00

RM100.00



23Finance

Item Description of Instrument Proper Stamp Duty

	 (C)	 exceeds 
RM500,000.00 but 
does not exceed 
RM1,000,000.00

	 (D)	 exceeds 
RM1,000,000.00

	 (ii)	 in any other case

RM500.00

RM1,000.00

See Conveyance”;

	 (b)	 in subitem 22(6), by substituting for the words  
“the conventional hire purchase and Syariah principles” 
the words “any Syariah principles or conventional  
hire purchase”;

	 (c)	 in item 29, in the column of “Proper Stamp Duty”,  
by substituting for the words “15 cent” the words “RM1.00”;

	 (d)	 in subsubitem 32(e)(i), in the column of “Proper Stamp 
Duty”, by inserting after the words “Duty as in (a),” 
the words “(aa),”;

	 (e)	 in item 49—

	 (i)	 by substituting for subitem (a) and the particulars 
relating to it the following subitem and particulars:

Item Description
of

Instrument

Proper Stamp Duty

“(a)	 Without fine 
or premium 
when the 
average rent 
and other 
considerations 
calculated 
for a whole 
year—

For every RM250.00 or part thereof,  
when the lease is for a period—

Not 
exceeding 
one year

Exceeding 
one year 
but not 

exceeding 
three 
years

Exceeding 
three 
years 

but not 
exceeding 
five years

Exceeding 
five years 
or for any 
indefinite 

period

RM1.00 RM3.00 RM5.00 RM7.00

		  and

	 (ii)	 in subitem (e), by substituting for the word 
“Commissioner” the word “Collector”; and

”; 



24 Bill

	 (f)	 by substituting for item 59 and the particulars relating 
to it the following item and particulars:

Item Description of Instrument Proper Stamp Duty

“59 POWER OR LETTER OF ATTORNEY:

(a)	 being conveyance of real property in 
consideration of, and creating by way 
of sale or gift

The same duty as 
a conveyance on 
sale

(b)	 in any other case RM10.00

Exemption

For the sole purposes of appointment  
or authorizing any person to vote as proxy 
at a meeting of a Company or Association”.

Chapter V

AMENDMENT TO THE PETROLEUM (INCOME TAX)
ACT 1967

Commencement of amendment to the Petroleum (Income Tax) 
Act 1967

28.	 This Chapter comes into operation on the coming into 
operation of this Act.

Amendment of First Schedule

29.	 The Petroleum (Income Tax) Act 1967 is amended in  
paragraph 3a  of the First Schedule by substituting for  
subparagraph (4) the following subparagraph:

	 “(4)  Any amount deducted under subparagraphs (1) and (2) 
shall be disregarded for the purpose of ascertaining the adjusted 
income of the first-mentioned chargeable person.”.



25Finance

Chapter VI

AMENDMENT TO THE FINANCE ACT 2012

Commencement of amendment to the Finance Act 2012

30.	 This Chapter comes into operation on the coming into 
operation of this Act.

Amendment of section 3

31.	 The Finance Act 2012 is amended in subsection 3(4)  
by substituting for the words “until the year of assessment 2025” 
the words “until the year of assessment 2030”.

Chapter VII

AMENDMENT TO THE FINANCE (NO. 2) ACT 2023

Commencement of amendment to the Finance (No. 2) Act 2023

32.	 This Chapter comes into operation on the same date and  
in the same manner as section 30 of the Finance (No. 2) Act 2023  
comes into operation.

Amendment of section 30

33.	 Section 30 of the Finance (No. 2) Act 2023 is amended—

	 (a)	 in subsection 157(1)—

	 (i)	 in the definition of “Acceptable Financial  
Accounting Standard”, by deleting the words 
“Malaysia,”;

	 (ii)	 in the definition of “Investment Entity”,  
by substituting for paragraph (a) the following 
paragraph:

	 “(a)	 an Investment Fund, a Real Estate 
Investment Vehicle or an Insurance 
Investment Entity;”; and



26 Bill

	 (iii)	 by inserting after the definition of “Main Entity” 
the following definition:

	 ‘ “Marketable Transferable Tax Credit” 
means a tax credit, other than a Qualified 
Refundable Tax Credit, which can be used 
to reduce liability for a Covered Tax in  
the jurisdiction that issues the tax credit and 
the tax credit is transferable—

	 (a)	 in  relat ion to  the or iginator  of  
a Marketable Transferable Tax Credit—

	 (i)	 where the originator transfers the 
tax credit to an unrelated party, 
the transfer shall take place in 
the Financial Year in which the 
originator was eligible for the tax 
credit or within fifteen months 
of the end of that Financial Year 
at a price that equals or exceeds 
eighty per cent of the net present 
value of the tax credit; or

	 (ii)	 where the tax credit is not transferred 
or transferred between related 
parties, similar tax credit may be 
traded between unrelated parties 
within fifteen months of the end 
of that Financial Year at a price 
that equals or exceeds eighty  
per cent of the net present value 
of the tax credit; and

	 (b)	 in relation to the purchaser of a Marketable 
Transferable Tax Credit, the purchaser, 
who is unrelated to the originator, 
may transfer the tax credit to another 
unrelated purchaser under the same 
or similar conditions as would apply 
to the originator at a price that equals 
or exceeds eighty per cent of the net 
present value of the tax credit in the 
Financial Year in which it purchases 
the tax credit;’;



27Finance

	 (b)	 in section 162, by substituting for subsection (2)  
the following subsection:

	 “(2)  A Parent Entity’s Inclusion Ratio for a Low-Taxed  
Constituent Entity for a Financial Year shall be 
determined in accordance with the following formula:

A – B
A

where A is the GloBE Income of the Low-Taxed 
Constituent Entity for the Financial 
Year; and

B is the amount of  such income 
attributable to Ownership Interests 
held by other owners.”;

	 (c)	 in section 164—

	 (i)	 by renumbering the exist ing sect ion as  
subsection (1); and

	 (ii)	 by inserting after the renumbered subsection (1) 
the following subsections:

	 “(2)  For the purposes of the Domestic 
Top-up Tax, the Financial Accounting Net 
Income or Loss of a Constituent Entity which 
is a member of a Multinational Enterprise 
Group and located in Malaysia but not being 
a Permanent Establishment of a Main Entity 
shall be determined based on the financial 
statement of the Constituent Entity if—

	 (a)	 all of the Constituent Entities of the 
Multinational Enterprise Group which 
are located in Malaysia have the 
same Financial Year as the Ultimate 
Parent Entity of the Multinational 
Enterprise Group; and



28 Bill

	 (b)	 each of the Constituent Entities  
prepares its own financial statements 
and the financial statements—

	 (i)	 are required to be kept or 
used under any written law 
of Malaysia; or

	 (ii)	 are audited by an approved 
company auditor.

	 (3)  Where a Constituent Entity located in 
Malaysia is a Permanent Establishment of  
a Main Entity, subsection (2) shall apply to the 
Constituent Entity if, in addition to meeting 
the requirements in paragraphs 2(a) and (b), 
the Main Entity prepares separate financial 
statements for the Constituent Entity.

	 (4)  For the purposes of this section, 
“approved company auditor” and “financial 
statement” have the meanings assigned to 
them in subsection 2(1) of the Companies 
Act 2016.”;

	 (d)	 in subsection 165(10), by inserting after the words 
“Qualif ied Refundable Tax Credits” the words  
“and Marketable Transferable Tax Credits”;

	 (e)	 in section 169—

	 (i)	 in subsection (5)—

	 (A)	 in paragraph (c), by deleting the word 
“and” at the end of the paragraph;

	 (B)	 in paragraph (d), by substituting for  
the full stop at the end of the paragraph 
the words “; and”; and



29Finance

	 (C)	 by inser t ing af ter  paragraph (d)   
the following paragraph:

	 “(e)	 any amount  of  credi t  of  a 
Constituent Entity for the Financial  
Year in respect of a Marketable 
Transferable Tax Credit that  
is recorded as a reduction to  
the current tax expense.”; and

	 (ii)	 in subsection (6)—

	 (A)	 in paragraph (b), by substituting for the 
words “in respect of a Non-Qualified 
Refundable Tax Credit” the words “other 
than a Qualified Refundable Tax Credit 
and Marketable Transferable Tax Credit”; 
and

	 (B)	 by substi tuting for paragraph (c)  
the following paragraph:

	 “(c)	 any amount of credit or refund 
for Covered Taxes, except for  
a Qualified Refundable Tax Credit 
or Marketable Transferable Tax 
Credit, to a Constituent Entity that 
is not treated as an adjustment 
to current tax expense in the 
financial accounts;”;

	 (f)	 in subsection 173(6), by inserting after the word  
“adjustment” the words “under subsections (1) to (5)”;

	 (g)	 by deleting subsection 176(2);

	 (h)	 in subsection 177(1)—

	 (i)	 in the formula, in explanation C, by substituting 
for the words “subsection 169(3) or 181(1)”  
the words “subsections 169(3) and (4) or 
subsection 181(1)”; and

	 (ii)	 in the formula, in explanation D, by deleting  
the words “the Domestic Top-up Tax, being”;



30 Bill

	 (i)	 in subsection 180(9), by inserting after the words 
“amortisation,” the words “impairment loss”;

	 (j)	 in subsection 181(3), by substituting for the word 
“paragraph” the word “section”;

	 (k)	 by deleting subsection 192(12);

	 (l)	 by substituting for section 197 the following section:

“Transitional relief for the Substance-based Income 
Exclusion

197.  (1)  For the purpose of applying subsection 180(4) 
to a Financial Year beginning in the calendar year  
of 2025 and subsequent calendar years until the calendar 
year of 2032, the amount of payroll carve-out for  
each Financial Year shall be computed according to  
the following rate:

Financial Year beginning in the 
following calendar year

Rate

2025 9.6%
2026 9.4%
2027 9.2%
2028 9.0%
2029 8.2%
2030 7.4%
2031 6.6%
2032 5.8%

	 (2)  For the purpose of applying subsection 180(5) 
to a Financial Year beginning in the calendar year  
of 2025 and subsequent calendar years until the calendar 
year of 2032, the amount of tangible asset carve-out 
for each Financial Year shall be computed according  
to the following rate:

Financial Year beginning in the
following calendar year

Rate

2025 7.6%
2026 7.4%



31Finance

Financial Year beginning in the
following calendar year

Rate

2027 7.2%
2028 7.0%
2029 6.6%
2030 6.2%
2031 5.8%
2032 5.4%”;

	 (m)	 in subparagraph 199(1)(a)(iv), by substituting for  
the word “paragraphs” the word “subparagraphs”;

	 (n)	 in section 220—

	 (i)	 in subsection (1), by substituting for the words 
“subsection (2)” the words “subsection (3)”;

	 (ii)	 in subsection (4), by substituting for the word 
“Where” the words “Subject to subsection (6), 
where”; and

	 (iii)	 in subsection (5), by substituting for the words 
“subsection (7)” the words “subsection (6)”; and

	 (o)	 by substituting for paragraph 239(b) the following 
paragraph:

	 “(b)	 section 138 shall apply to this Part and the reference 
to “the income of any person or partnership”  
in the definition of “classified material” in  
subsection 138(5) shall be construed as a reference 
to “the tax of any Constituent Entity”; and”.

EXPLANATORY STATEMENT

This Bill seeks to amend the Income Tax Act 1967 (“Act 53”), the Real 
Property Gains Tax Act 1976 (“Act 169”), the Stamp Act 1949 (“Act 378”), 
the Petroleum (Income Tax) Act 1967 (“Act 543”), the Finance Act 2012  
(“Act 742”) and the Finance (No. 2) Act 2023 (“Act 851”).



32 Bill

AMENDMENTS TO THE INCOME TAX ACT 1967

Chapter II of this Bill seeks to amend the Income Tax Act 1967.

2.	 Clause 4 seeks to introduce a new paragraph 6(1)(r) into Act 53 to provide that 
income tax shall be charged on the dividend income of an individual who is a shareholder 
of a company, either through direct shareholding or through a nominee where  
such income is deemed to be derived from Malaysia by virtue of section 14 
of Act 53, at the rate specified under Part XXII of Schedule 1 to Act 53.

	 This amendment has effect for the year of assessment 2025 and subsequent 
years of assessment.

3.	 Clause 5 seeks to amend section 15c of Act 53.

	 Paragraph 5(a) seeks to amend subsection 15c(1) of Act 53 consequential 
to the introduction of a new subsection 15c(2a) into Act 53, to provide that 
the application of subsection 15c(1) of Act 53 is also subjected to the new 
subsection 15c(2a).

	 Subparagraph 5(b)(i) seeks to amend subsection 15c(2) of Act 53 to clarify 
that the disposal of the capital asset under section 15c of Act 53 applies to 
the shares of a relevant company acquired by a company, limited liability 
partnership, trust body or co-operative society.

	 Subparagraph 5(b)(ii) seeks to substitute paragraph 15c(2)(b) of Act 53  
consequential to the introduction of a new definition of “another controlled 
company”.

	 Subparagraph 5(b)(iv) seeks to introduce a new proviso into subsection 15c(2)  
of Act 53 to provide that where at any date a relevant company disposes 
real property situated in Malaysia or shares in another controlled company,  
or both, and with the disposal, the defined value of the real property situated 
in Malaysia or the shares of another controlled company, or both, owned by  
the relevant company, has been reduced to less than seventy-five per cent of 
the value of its total tangible asset, the relevant company is no longer regarded 
as a relevant company under subsection 15c(1) of Act 53 from the date  
of the disposal.

	 Paragraph 5(c) seeks to introduce a new subsection 15c(2a) into Act 53  
to clarify that where a relevant company is a real property company under 
Act 169 prior to 1 January 2024, the date of acquisition of the shares  
of the relevant company as a real property company as determined in 
accordance with subparagraph 34a(2) of Schedule 2 to that Act is deemed to be  
the date of the acquisition of the shares of the relevant company under section 15c  
of Act 53.



33Finance

	 Paragraph 5(d) seeks to amend subsection 15c(3) of Act 53 to provide that 
where the defined value of the real property situated in Malaysia or the shares of  
another controlled company, or both, owned by a relevant company, is less than 
seventy-five per cent from the value of total tangible assets of the relevant 
company and the relevant company subsequently acquires real property situated 
in Malaysia or shares of another controlled company, or both, and with the 
acquisition, the defined value is increased to seventy-five per cent or more,  
the date of the acquisition of shares of the relevant company by a company, limited 
liability partnership, trust body or co-operative society is deemed to be equal  
to the date of the subsequent acquisition of the real property or shares  
of another controlled company, or both, by the relevant company.

	 Subparagraph 5(e)(i) seeks to amend subsection 15c(4) of Act 53 to provide 
that where subsection 15c(3) of Act 53 applies, the acquisition price of the 
shares of a relevant company is deemed to be equal to the sums as determined 
in accordance with the formula in paragraph 15c(4)(a) of Act 53.

	 Subparagraph 5(e)(ii) seeks to amend subsection 15c(4) of Act 53 to provide 
that where subsection 15c(2) of Act 53 applies, the acquisition price of the 
shares of a relevant company is determined according to paragraph 65e(2)(b)  
or subsection 65e(8) of Act 53.

	 Paragraph 5(f) seeks to introduce a new subsection 15c(4a) into Act 53 
to clarify that where a relevant company is a real property company under 
Act 169 prior to 1 January 2024, the acquisition price of the shares of the 
relevant company as a real property company as determined in accordance with 
subparagraph 34a(3) of Schedule 2 to that Act is deemed to be the acquisition 
price of the shares of the relevant company under section 15c of Act 53.

	 Paragraph 5(g) seeks to introduce a new definition of “another controlled 
company” into subsection 15c(5) of Act 53 to provide that another controlled 
company is a controlled company which owns real property situated in Malaysia 
(including any right or interest thereof) or shares in another controlled company, 
or both, and the defined value of the real property or shares, or both, is not 
less than seventy-five per cent of the value of its total tangible asset.

	 These amendments come into operation on 1 January 2025.

4.	 Clause 6 seeks to amend subsection 34(6) of Act 53.

	 Paragraph 6(a) seeks to substitute paragraph 34(6)(h) of Act 53 to provide  
for the new conditions for deductions under that paragraph in relation to the contribution  
made to a charity or community project. If the amount of contribution is more  
than three hundred thousand ringgit, the contribution shall be verified by the 
relevant government authority and the charity or community project shall be 
approved by the Minister of Finance. For the amount of contribution which  
is not more than three hundred thousand ringgit, the contribution and the charity  
or community project only needs to be verified and approved by the relevant 
government authority.



34 Bill

	 Paragraph 6(b) seeks to substitute paragraph 34(6)(ha) of Act 53 to provide  
for the new conditions for deductions under that paragraph in relation to the 
expenditure on the provision of infrastructure. If the amount of the expenditure is 
more than three hundred thousand ringgit, the expenditure shall be verified by the 
relevant government authority and the provision of infrastructure shall be approved  
by the Minister of Finance. For the amount of the expenditure which is not 
more than three hundred thousand ringgit, the expenditure and the provision 
of infrastructure only needs to be verified and approved by the relevant 
government authority.

	 These amendments come into operation on 1 April 2025.

5.	 Clause 7 seeks to amend paragraph (k) in the definition of “organization” 
in subsection 44(7) of Act 53 to clarify that the words “serious disease” 
referred to in that paragraph is defined under subsection 2(1) of Act 53.

	 This amendment comes into operation on the coming into operation of this Act. 

6.	 Clause 8 seeks to amend subsection 45a(1) of Act 53 to provide that  
the amount for the individual deduction of a wife whose husband is a disabled 
person is increased from five thousand ringgit to six thousand ringgit.

	 This amendment has effect for the year of assessment 2025 and subsequent 
years of assessment.

7.	 Clause 9 seeks to amend subsection 46(1) of Act 53.

	 Paragraph 9(a) seeks to amend paragraph 46(1)(c) of Act 53 to expand 
the scope of the deduction for individual—

	 (a)	 to cover the expenses of medical treatment, dental treatment, complete 
medical examination, special needs and carers for grandparents; and

	 (b)	 in relation to complete medical examination to cover vaccination.

	 This amendment has effect for the year of assessment 2025 and  
subsequent years of assessment.

	 Paragraph 9(b) seeks to amend paragraph 46(1)(e) of Act 53 to provide  
that the individual deduction for disabled person is increased from  
six thousand ringgit to seven thousand ringgit.

	 This amendment has effect for the year of assessment 2025 and  
subsequent years of assessment.

	 Paragraph 9(c) seeks to amend paragraph 46(1)(h) of Act 53 to expand  
the scope of the deduction for individual to cover the expenses for the purchase  
of self-testing medical devices registered under the Medical Devices  
Act 2012 [Act 737] and the payment of fees for disease detection tests spent 
on himself, his spouse or children.

	 This amendment has effect for the year of assessment 2025 and  
subsequent years of assessment.



35Finance

	 Paragraph 9(d) seeks to amend paragraph 46(1)(ha) of Act 53 to provide 
that the individual deduction for the expenditure which is expended or deemed  
to be expended by an individual on his child who is of the age of eighteen years and below  
in respect of assessment for the purposes of diagnosis, early intervention programme  
or rehabilitation treatment for learning disabilities is increased from four 
thousand ringgit to six thousand ringgit.

	 This amendment has effect for the year of assessment 2025 and subsequent 
years of assessment.

	 Paragraph 9(e) seeks to amend paragraph 46(1)(k) of Act 53 to provide 
that either parent is eligible for the maximum deduction of eight thousand 
ringgit which is deposited into their respective Skim Simpanan Pendidikan 
Nasional account for their child and such deduction does not take into account 
any amount withdrawn from the account for the purposes of higher education 
expenses of the child. 

	 This amendment has effect from the year of assessment 2025 until the year 
of assessment 2027.

	 Paragraph 9(f) seeks to amend paragraph (c) of the proviso to paragraph 46(1)(r)  
of Act 53 to extend the period of three years from the year of assessment 2025 
to the year of assessment 2027 for an extended deduction of one thousand 
ringgit in respect of payment of child care fee to a child care centre registered 
with the Director General of Social Welfare under the Child Care Centre  
Act 1984 [Act 308] or a kindergarten registered under the Education Act 1996 
[Act 550] for children aged six years and below.

	 This amendment has effect from the year of assessment 2025 until the year 
of assessment 2027.

	 Paragraph 9(g) seeks to amend paragraph 46(1)(u) of Act 53 to expand 
the scope of deduction under that paragraph to the expenditure on the 
purchase of sports equipment for any sports activity as defined under the 
Sports Development Act 1997 [Act 576], the rental payment or entry fees to 
any sports facility, the registration fees for any sports competitions whose 
organizers are approved and licensed by the Sports Commissioner under Act 576  
and the fees for gymnasium membership or sports training provided by sports 
clubs or societies registered with the Sports Commissioner or a company 
incorporated under the Companies Act 2016 [Act 777] for parents resident 
in Malaysia.

	 This amendment has effect for the year of assessment 2025 and  
subsequent years of assessment.

	 Paragraph 9(h) seeks to amend paragraph 46(1)(v) of Act 53 to expand 
the scope of individual deductions under that paragraph to expenses for the 
purchase of food waste compost machines used for household purposes.

	 This amendment has effect from the year of assessment 2025 until the year 
of assessment 2027.



36 Bill

8.	 Clause 10 seeks to substitute section 46b of Act 53. This amendment seeks 
to provide for a new deduction for individuals in respect of interest expended  
to finance the purchase of the first residential home. With this amendment, an individual 
is eligible to get a personal deduction of seven thousand ringgit for a residential 
home which is not more than five hundred thousand ringgit and five thousand 
ringgit for a residential home which is more than five hundred thousand ringgit but 
not more than seven hundred and fifty thousand ringgit, so long as the sale and  
purchase agreement concerned is executed between 1 January 2025 and  
31 December 2027, if the individual meets the requirements specified in that 
section.

	 This amendment comes into operation on 1 January 2025.

9.	 Clause 11 seeks to amend paragraph 47(1)(b) of Act 53 to provide that 
the amount for the individual deduction of a husband whose wife is a disabled 
person is increased from five thousand ringgit to six thousand ringgit.

	 This amendment has effect for the year of assessment 2025 and subsequent 
years of assessment.

10.	 Clause 12 seeks to amend paragraph 48(2)(b) of Act 53 to provide that 
the deduction for an individual who pays for the maintenance of each of his 
unmarried child proven to be physically or mentally disable is increased from 
six thousand ringgit to eight thousand ringgit for each child.

	 This amendment has effect for the year of assessment 2025 and subsequent 
years of assessment.

11.	 Clause 13 seeks to amend subsection 49(1b) of Act 53 to provide that  
the deduction for an individual who pays premium for insurance on education 
or for medical benefits is increased from three thousand ringgit to four 
thousand ringgit.

	 This amendment has effect for the year of assessment 2025 and subsequent 
years of assessment.

12.	 Clause 14 seeks to amend the proviso to subsection 107c(8) of Act 53 
to enable any company, limited liability partnership, trust body or co-operative 
society to furnish revised estimate for a year of assessment in accordance with 
subsection 107c(7) of Act 53 if the direction by the Director General under 
subsection 107c(8) of Act 53 is issued before the eleventh month of the basis 
period for the year of assessment.

	 This amendment has effect for the year of assessment 2025 and subsequent 
years of assessment.

13.	 Clause 15 seeks to amend section 108 of Act 53 to require a company, 
upon paying, crediting or distributing a dividend which is deemed to be derived  
from Malaysia by virtue of section 14 of Act 53, to furnish individual shareholders 
with a certificate stating the gross amount of the dividend and the amount of 
dividend paid or credited, or where the dividend includes property other than 
money, also stating the market value of that property at the time of distribution.

	 This amendment has effect for the year of assessment 2025 and subsequent 
years of assessment.



37Finance

14.	 Clause 16 seeks to introduce a new Part XXII into Schedule 1 to Act 53 
to provide that income tax shall be charged at a rate of two per cent on every 
ringgit of an individual’s chargeable income from dividend paid, credited or 
distributed by a company and the dividend is deemed by virtue of section 14 of 
Act 53 to be derived from Malaysia in excess of one hundred thousand ringgit. 
Clause 16 also seeks to empower the Minister to prescribe the chargeable income 
of individual who has any other source of income besides dividend.

	 This amendment has effect for the year of assessment 2025 and subsequent 
years of assessment.

15.	 Clause 17 seeks to amend paragraph 12b of Schedule 6 to Act 53.

	 Paragraph 17(b) seeks to amend paragraph 12b  of Schedule 6  
to Act 53 which has been renumbered as subparagraph 12b(1) of Schedule 6 
to Act 53 to provide that an exemption under the subparagraph shall apply 
to a person who is not an individual.

	 Paragraph 17(c) seeks to introduce a new subparagraph 12b(2) into Schedule 6  
to Act 53 to provide that the dividend paid, credited or distributed to  
an individual for an amount not exceeding one hundred thousand ringgit and 
any deduction relating to it is disregarded for the purpose of ascertaining 
chargeable income of that individual.

	 These amendments have effect for the year of assessment 2025 and subsequent 
years of assessment.

AMENDMENTS TO THE REAL PROPERTY GAINS TAX ACT 1976

Chapter III of this Bill seeks to amend the Real Property Gains Tax Act 1976.

16.	 Clause 19 seeks to amend section 3 of Act 169.

	 Paragraph 19(a) seeks to amend subsection 3(2) of Act 169 to provide that 
the real property gains tax shall be charged on each ringgit of the amount 
of chargeable gain accruing to a chargeable person in a year of assessment 
instead of the total amount of chargeable gain for that year of assessment. 
With this amendment, tax is charged separately on chargeable gain accruing 
on each disposal of the real property.

	 Paragraph 19(b) seeks to introduce a new subsection (2a) into Act 169  
to provide that the chargeable gain on each disposal of chargeable asset for a 
year of assessment is ascertained separately and treated as a separate chargeable 
gain from each disposal.

	 These amendments come into operation on 1 January 2025.

17.	 Clause 20 seeks to amend section 7 of Act 169.

	 Paragraph 20(a) seeks to amend paragraph 7(4)(a) of Act 169 to provide 
that an allowable loss in respect of a disposal of chargeable asset in a year  
of assessment shall only be allowed as a deduction to reduce the chargeable gain 
in the subsequent disposal of chargeable asset in the same year of assessment.



38 Bill

	 Paragraph 20(b) seeks to amend paragraph 7(4)(b) of Act 169 to provide 
that where the allowable loss cannot be deducted in a year of assessment  
by reason of insufficiency or absence of chargeable gain in the year of assessment,  
the allowable loss shall be allowed as a deduction against the chargeable gain 
for the first subsequent year of assessment for which there is total chargeable 
gain from the disposal of chargeable asset at an earlier point in time and  
for subsequent years of assessment until the whole amount of allowable loss 
has been allowed.

	 These amendments come into operation on 1 January 2025.

18.	 Clause 21 seeks to amend section 11 of Act 169 to provide that  
a chargeable person shall be assessed for any year of assessment in respect  
of the amount of his chargeable gain accruing on each disposal of  
chargeable asset as ascertained under subsection 3(2) of Act 169.

	 This amendment comes into operation on 1 January 2025.

19.	 Clause 22 seeks to amend section 21 of Act 169.

	 Paragraph 22(a) seeks to amend subsection 21(1a) of Act 169 consequential 
to the introduction of the self-assessment system. The proposed amendment 
provides that any tax payable under an assessment on a return made under 
subsection 14(1) of Act 169 shall be due and payable within ninety days from 
the date of disposal.

	 Paragraph 22(b) seeks to substitute subsection 21(4) of Act 169 to provide 
that an increment of ten per cent will be imposed on any tax due and payable 
under subsection 21(1a) of Act 169 which was not paid within the period  
of ninety days from the date of disposal.

	 These amendments come into operation on 1 January 2025.

AMENDMENTS TO THE STAMP ACT 1949

Chapter IV of this Bill seeks to amend the Stamp Act 1949.

20.	 Clause 24 seeks to amend section 20a of Act 378 to impose ad valorem 
duty on the exchange of real property as a conveyance on sale irrespective 
of whether the exchange involves a consideration. The proposed amendment 
also provides that the exchange of real property between certain parties will 
not be subject to ad valorem duty.

	 This amendment comes into operation on 1 January 2025.

21.	 Clause 25 seeks to introduce new sections 36ca and 36cb into Act 378.

	 The new section 36ca seeks to empower the Collector to raise additional 
assessment if there is any form of fraud or wilful default or negligence  
in respect of duty on an instrument as a consequence of the introduction  
of the self-assessment system for stamp duty.



39Finance

	 The new section 36cb seeks to provide that the minimum duty of ten ringgit  
is imposed on an instrument if the duty is less than ten ringgit except  
for cheque and contract note.

	 The new section 36ca  comes into operation on 1 January 2026,  
while the new section 36cb comes into operation on 1 January 2025.

22.	 Clause 26 seeks to amend section 47a of Act 378 to provide for a cross 
reference to section 43 of Act 378 in relation to the imposition of penalty on 
cheques and promissory notes which are not furnished with a return under 
the proposed new section 35a of Act 378 which is introduced through the 
Measures for the Collection, Administration and Enforcement of Tax Bill 2024 
to the Collector within thirty days after it was first received in Malaysia. In 
furtherance, the proposed amendment also seeks to substitute subsection (1) 
by providing for a new penalty as follows:

	 (a)	 fifty ringgit or ten per centum of the amount of the deficient duty  
if the instrument is stamped within the period of three months after 
the time for stamping; or

	 (b)	 one hundred ringgit or twenty per centum of the amount of the 
deficient duty if the instrument is stamped later than the period  
of three months after the time for stamping.

	 This amendment comes into operation on 1 January 2025.

23.	 Clause 27 seeks to amend the First Schedule to Act 378.

	 Paragraph 27(a) seeks to substitute for item 12 of the First Schedule  
to Act 378 to provide for the rates of duty for an instrument of assignment of policy  
of life insurance by way of gift or trust and the rate of duty is dependent  
on the amount of sum insured under the policy.

	 Paragraph 27(b) seeks to amend subitem 22(6) of the First Schedule  
to Act 378 to clarify that the instrument for securing the payment or repayment  
of money for the purchase of goods within the meaning given under  
the First Schedule to the Hire Purchase Act 1967 [Act 212] in accordance  
with any Syariah principles or conventional hire purchase is chargeable to duty  
of ten ringgit.

	 Paragraph 27(c) seeks to amend item 29 of the First Schedule to Act 378 
to increase the rate of duty chargeable on the instrument of cheque from  
fifteen cent to one ringgit for each cheque issued.

	 Paragraph 27(d) seeks to amend subsubitem 32(e)(i) of the First Schedule 
to Act 378 consequential to the introduction of subitem 32(aa) of the  
First Schedule to Act 378 which introduced the rate of duty for an instrument 
in relation to conveyance, assignment, transfer or absolute bill of sale of any  
property to a foreign company or a person who is not a citizen and not  
a permanent resident.



40 Bill

	 Subparagraph 27(e)(i) seeks to amend subitem 49(a) of the First Schedule 
 to Act 378 to delete the threshold value of two thousand and four hundred  
ringgit in item 49 for an instrument in relation to rent or lease from being imposed  
a stamp duty. The rate of chargeable duty is increased from one ringgit,  
two ringgit or four ringgit to one ringgit, three ringgit, five ringgit or seven ringgit  
for each two hundred and fifty ringgit or part of two hundred and fifty ringgit 
in accordance with the rent period. This rate is also applicable to an instrument 
where the rent or lease amounting to two thousand and four hundred ringgit 
and below per year.

	 Subparagraph 27(e)(ii) seeks to amend subitem 49(e) of the First Schedule 
to Act 378 to substitute for the word “Commissioner” the word “Collector” 
for the purposes of uniformity of reference in Act 378.

	 Paragraph 27(f) seeks to amend item 59 of the First Schedule to Act 378 
to impose an ad valorem duty for power or letter of attorney which involves 
conveyance of real property.

	 These amendments come into operation on 1 January 2025.

AMENDMENT TO THE PETROLEUM (INCOME TAX) ACT 1967

Chapter V of this Bill seeks to amend the Petroleum (Income Tax) Act 1967.

24.	 Clause 29 seeks to substitute subparagraph 3a(4) of the First Schedule  
to Act 543 to clarify that any amount deducted in relation to the first-mentioned 
chargeable person shall be disregarded for the purpose of ascertaining  
the adjusted income of the first-mentioned chargeable person since the qualifying 
exploration expenditure exceeds the gross income of the second-mentioned 
chargeable person, the excess of the expenditure shall only be allowed to be 
deducted from the gross income of that second-mentioned chargeable person 
for the subsequent years of assessment.

	 This amendment comes into operation on the coming into operation of this Act. 

AMENDMENT TO THE FINANCE ACT 2012

Chapter VI of this Bill seeks to amend the Finance Act 2012.

25.	 Clause 31 seeks to amend subsection 3(4) of Act 742 to extend the period 
of deduction by an individual for premium payments for deferred annuities  
and contributions made to private retirement schemes until the year of  
assessment 2030.

	 This amendment comes into operation on the coming into operation of this 
Act.



41Finance

AMENDMENT TO THE FINANCE (NO. 2) ACT 2023

Chapter VII of this Bill seeks to amend the Finance (No. 2) Act 2023.

26.	 Clause 33 seeks to amend section 30 of Act 851, which seeks to amend 
the provisions of Act 53.

	 Subparagraph 33(a)(i) seeks to amend the definition of “Acceptable Financial 
Accounting Standard” in subsection 157(1) of Act 53 by deleting the word 
“Malaysia” as the reference is no longer necessary since Malaysia has adopted 
International Financial Reporting Standards.

	 Subparagraph 33(a)(ii) seeks to amend the definition of “Investment Entity” 
so that the definition includes Insurance Investment Entity.

	 Subparagraph 33(a)(iii) seeks to introduce the definition of “Marketable 
Transferable Tax Credit” consistent with the amendment to the GloBE Model 
Rules.

	 Paragraph 33(b) seeks to amend subsection 162(2) of Act 53 to clarify 
the formula of Parent Entity’s Inclusion Ratio for a Low-Taxed Constituent 
Entity in a Financial Year which is applicable for the purposes of section 162 
of Act 53.

	 Paragraph 33(c) seeks to amend section 164 of Act 53 to provide that  
for the purposes of Domestic Top-up Tax, the Financial Accounting Net Income 
or Loss of a Constituent Entity located in Malaysia shall be determined based 
on the financial statements of the Constituent Entity which are prepared  
in accordance with a permitted accounting standard in Malaysia, subject to other  
requirements in that section.

	 Paragraph 33(d) seeks to amend subsection 165(10) of Act 53 to provide 
that the Marketable Transferable Tax Credits shall be treated as income  
in the computation of GloBE Income or Loss of a Constituent Entity so that 
the provision is consistent with the amendment to the GloBE Model Rules.

	 Subparagraph 33(e)(i) seeks to introduce a new paragraph (5)(e) into section 169  
of Act 53 to provide that any amount of Marketable Transferable Tax Credit  
that is recorded as a reduction to the current tax expense is one of the Additions 
to Covered Taxes.

	 Subsubparagraph 33(e)(ii)(A) seeks to amend paragraph 169(6)(b) of Act 53  
to provide that any amount of credit or refund other than Qualified Refundable 
Tax Credit or Marketable Transferable Tax Credit that is not recorded  
as a reduction to the current tax expense is one of the Reductions to Covered 
Taxes.

	 Subsubparagraph 33(e)(ii)(B) seeks to amend paragraph 169(6)(c) of Act 53 
to provide that any amount of Qualified Refundable Tax Credit or Marketable 
Transferable Tax Credit which is credited or refunded to a Constituent Entity 
but not treated as an adjustment to the current tax expense of the Constituent 
Entity is not a Reduction to Covered Taxes.



42 Bill

	 Paragraph 33(f) seeks to amend subsection 173(6) of Act 53 to clarify 
that the adjustment referred to in that subsection is adjustments made under 
subsections 173(1) to (5) of Act 53.

	 Paragraph 33(g) seeks to delete subsection 176(2) of Act 53 as a consequence 
of the amendment made to section 164 of Act 53.

	 Subparagraph 33(h)(i) seeks to amend the formula in relation to item C 
of subsection 177(1) of Act 53 to clarify that subsections 169(3) and (4)  
of Act 53 shall be read together to determine the amount treated as Additional 
Current Multinational Top-up Tax.

	 Subparagraph 33(h)(ii) seeks to amend the formula in relation to item D 
of subsection 177(1) of Act 53 to clarify that item D is the amount payable 
under a Qualified Domestic Top-up Tax imposed on the Constituent Entity 
located in another country.

	 Paragraph 33(i) seeks to amend subsection 180(9) of Act 53 to clarify that 
the impairment loss shall be included in the computation of carrying value  
of Eligible Tangible Asset.

	 Subparagraphs 33(n)(i) and (iii) seek to amend subsections 220(1) and (5) 
of Act 53 to clarify the references in the subsections.

	 Subparagraph 33(n)(ii) seeks to amend subsection 220(4) of Act 53  
to provide that the application of the subsection is subjected to subsection 220(6)  
of Act 53.

	 Paragraph 33(o) seeks to amend paragraph 239(b) of Act 53 to provide that  
the reference to “the income of any person or partnership” in the definition 
of “classified material” in subsection 138(5) of Act 53 shall be taken  
as a reference to “the tax of any Constituent Entity”.

	 These amendments come into operation on the same date and in the same 
manner as section 30 of the Finance (No. 2) Act 2023 comes into operation.

GENERAL

27.	 Other amendments not specifically dealt with in this Explanatory Statement 
are minor or consequential in nature.

FINANCIAL IMPLICATIONS

This Bill will not involve the Government in any extra financial expenditure.

[PN(U2)3393]


